Price is Labor Rate per Hour

ATTACHMENT A

AWARD RECOMMENDATION

IFB 24-FSD-001
VEHICLE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR SERVICES

GROUP 1 - OEM
Offer Automotive Class 1 Class 2 Class 3 Class 4 Class 5 Class 6 Class 7 Class 8 RECOMMENDED *

Courtesy Chevrolet S 135.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 135.00 155.00 155.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid X

Don Sanderson Ford S 115.00 | $ 115.00 | $ 115.00 | $ 115.00 115.00 115.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 135.00 | S 135.00 X

Earnhardt Chevrolet S 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid X

Earnhardt Ford Sales Company S 100.00 | S 100.00 | $ 100.00 | S 100.00 100.00 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid X

H&E Equipment Services, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 140.00 | $ 140.00 X

Rodeo Ford, Inc. S 145.00 | S 145.00 | S 145.00 | S 145.00 145.00 145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid X

Rush Truck Center, Phoenix No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 133.00 | $ 133.00 X

RWC International No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 135.00 135.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 135.00 | S 135.00 X

Sands Chevrolet S 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 100.00 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 X

San Tan Ford $ 144.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid X

GROUP 2 - NON OEM
Offer Automotive Class 1 Class 2 Class 3 Class 4 Class 5 Class 6 Class 7 Class 8 RECOMMENDED *

All Fleet Services LLC S 103.30 | $ 103.30 | $ 103.30 | $ 113.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid X

Fleet Line Truck & Equipment Rep No Bid No Bid No Bid 135.00 135.00 135.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 135.00 X

H&E Equipment Services, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 140.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 140.00 X

RWC International No Bid No Bid No Bid 135.00 No Bid No Bid S 135.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 135.00 X

S & K Transmission Service, Inc. S 125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 125.00 125.00 125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 X

Sands Chevrolet S 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 X

Perez Auto, LLC. S 120.00 | $ 135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid X

Beuks Auto Group S 109.99 | $ 109.99 | $ 109.99 | $ 109.99 149.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid X




