

Attachment A

IFB 24-FSD-017
Automotive and Equipment Rebuild/Repair Parts Service

Recommended Groups																
Vendor	Group 1	Rec.	Group 2	Rec.	Group 3	Rec.	Group 4	Rec.	Group 5	Rec.	Group 6	Rec.	Group 7	Rec.	Group 8	Rec.
Back to Basic Automotive	\$109.60	X	\$109.60	X	No Bid		\$109.60	X	\$109.60	X	\$109.60	X	\$109.60	X	\$109.60	X
Cohone Technologies Sales & Services, LLC	\$80.00	X	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
INLAND KENWORTH	No Bid		\$164.00	X	No Bid		\$164.00	X	\$164.00	X	\$164.00	X	\$164.00	X	\$164.00	X
Master Machinery LLC	\$125.00	X	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Midway Chevrolet	No Bid		\$93.75	X	No Bid		\$93.75	X	\$93.75	X	\$93.75	X	\$93.75	X	\$93.75	X
Serck Services	No Bid		\$58.00	X	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Velocity Vehicle Group	\$129.00	X	\$129.00	X	\$129.00	X	\$129.00	X	\$129.00	X	\$129.00	X	\$129.00	X	\$129.00	X
AAPAK	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$180.00	X	No Bid		No Bid	
W. W. Williams Co. LLC	No Bid		No Bid		\$105.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	