

Attachment A - Bid Summary

IFB 23-FMD-016 HVAC Maintenance, Repair, and Replacement Services Award Recommendation

Offeror	Group I - Commercial		Group II - Residential		Group III - Duct Design, Installation, and Fabrication		Group IV - Low Temperature Coolers/Freezers		Group V - Commercial (Aviation Only)		Group VI - Residential (Aviation Only)		Group VII - Duct Design, Installation, and Fabrication (Aviation Only)	
A Quality HVAC Services, LLC	\$ 14,150.00		\$ 14,150.00	X	\$ 16,350.00		\$ 18,450.00		\$ 14,150.00		\$ 14,150.00		\$ 16,350.00	
Artic Air Heating & Cooling, Inc.	\$ 9,950.00	X	\$ 9,950.00	X	\$ 8,850.00	X	\$ 9,950.00	X	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Chiller Services, Inc.	\$ 12,800.00	X	\$ 11,600.00	X	\$ 11,500.00		\$ 12,100.00	X	\$ 12,700.00		\$ 12,100.00		\$ 11,500.00	
Comfort Systems USA Southwest	\$ 14,490.00		\$ 14,490.00		\$ 12,075.00		\$ 14,490.00		\$ 14,490.00		\$ 14,490.00		\$ 12,075.00	
Crawford Mechanical Services, LLC	\$ 10,580.00	X	No Bid		\$ 8,625.00	X	\$ 12,075.00	X	\$ 10,580.00	X	No Bid		\$ 8,625.00	X
HACI Service, LLC	\$ 10,925.00	X	\$ 10,925.00	X	\$ 6,900.00	X	\$ 12,650.00		\$ 11,500.00		\$ 10,925.00	X	\$ 6,900.00	X
Tolin Mechanical Systems	\$ 13,800.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 13,800.00		\$ 13,800.00		No Bid		No Bid	
Trane US, Inc.	\$ 18,214.90		\$ 14,755.00		\$ 16,748.60		\$ 18,214.90		\$ 18,214.90		\$ 16,748.60		\$ 16,748.60	
United Technologies, LLC	\$ 10,150.00	X	\$ 10,150.00	X	\$ 10,150.00	X	\$ 10,150.00	X	\$ 11,300.00	X	\$ 10,150.00	X	\$ 10,150.00	