ATTACHMENT A

Group One / A - Good (1 Year Warranty)- Automotive and Light Duty Truck

D.J. Walworth Award Award Award
Inc dba | Recommendation | _Inland Kenworth Recommendation J's Mobile Battery Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount Discount Discount
Item Description Quantity | Measure | Unit Cost (%) G s Unit Cost (%) it Unit Cost (%) s Tes
1 | BCIGROUPSIZE-24 1 EA 10.% $102.19 | 12.% 0 $108.96 2% 0
2 | BCIGROUP SIZE-27 1 EA 30.% $11071| 12.% 0 $120.22 2% 0
3 | BCIGROUP SIZE-34 1 EA 10.% $100.15 | 12.% 0 $108.69 2% 0
4 | BCIGROUP SIZE-48 1 EA 10.% $111.85| 12.% 0 $118.66 2% ]
5 | BCIGROUP SIZE-58 1 EA $104.95 | 30.% [m] $111.85| 12.% [m] 2%
6 BCI GROUP SIZE-58R 1 EA $133.95 30.% [m] 12.% $103.19 2.% [m]
7| BCIGROUP SIZE-65 1 EA 10.% 12.% [m] $122.22 2% [m]
BCI GROUP SIZE- -
8 65AGM 1 EA $222.95 30.% a 12.% $219.71 2.%
9 BCI GROUP SIZE-75 1 EA 10.% $89.08 12.% a $108.45 2.% U
10 | BCI GROUP SIZE-78 1 EA 10.% $97.44 | 12.% [m] $118.40 2.% 0
11 | BCI GROUP SIZE-86 1 EA 30.% O 12.% $103.48 2.% O
12 | BCI GROUP SIZE-90 1 EA 10.% $103.63 | 12.% [m] $121.66 2.% 0
13 | BCI GROUP SIZE-94R 1 EA 10.% | s12836] 12% [m] $134.20 2.% D
Group One / B - Better (2-3 Year - ive and Light Duty Truck
Continental Battery Award Award
Compant Recommendation | Inland Kenworth Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount Discount
item Description | Quantity | Measure (%) s Unit Cost| (%) o
1 BCI GROUP SIZE-24 1 EA 15.% $102.19 12.% a
2 BCI GROUP SIZE-27 1 EA 10.% $110.71 12.% a
3 [ BCIGROUP SIZE-34 1 EA 15.% O 12.%
4 BCI GROUP SIZE-48 1 EA 10.% $111.85 12.% a
5 BCI GROUP SIZE-58 1 EA 10.% $111.85 12.% a
6 | BCI GROUP SIZE-58R 1 EA 15.% $88.03 | 12.% [m]
7 | BCIGROUP SIZE-65 1 EA 15.% O 12.%
8 | BCIGROUP SIZE- 1 EA 15% 2% 0
9 | BCIGROUP SIZE-75 1 EA 15.% [m] 12.%
10 | BCIGROUP SIZE-78 1 EA $98.03 | 15.% [m] 12.%
11 BCI GROUP SIZE-86 1 EA 15.% $97.49 12.% a
12 BCI GROUP SIZE-90 1 EA 15.% $103.63 12.% UJ
13 | BCI GROUP SIZE-94R 1 EA 25.% $128.36 12.% UJ
Group One / C - Best ( 3+ Years or More Warranty) - and Light Duty Truck
Award Award
lliott auto supply co il Recommendation | Inland Kenworth Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount it
Item Description Quantity | Measure (%) s Unit Cost s
1 BCI GROUP SIZE-24 1 EA 0.% $102.19 12.% ]
2 BCI GROUP SIZE-27 1 EA $116.67 0.% a 12.%
3 BCI GROUP SIZE-34 1 EA $122.66 0.% [m] 12.%
4 BCI GROUP SIZE-48 1 EA $126.39 0.% a 12.%
5 | BCIGROUP SIZE-58 1 EA H 0.% 12.% [m]
6 BCI GROUP SIZE-58R 1 EA $94.14 0.% a 12.%
7 BCI GROUP SIZE-65 1 EA $113.85 0.% [m] 12.%
8 | BCIGROUP SIZE- 1 EA H 0% 12.% [m]
9 | BCIGROUP SIZE-75 1 EA $124.09 | 0.% [m] 12.%
10 BCI GROUP SIZE-78 1 EA $114.11 0.% U 12.%
11 BCI GROUP SIZE-86 1 EA $105.56 0.% UJ 12.%
12 BCI GROUP SIZE-90 1 EA $109.72 0.% 12.%
13 | BCI GROUP SIZE-94R 1 EA $148.61 0.% UJ 12.%
Group Two / A - Good (1 Year Warranty)-Medium Duty Truck-(BCl Group 31, Auto Post and Stud cable h will be |
Award
Inland Kenworth | Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount
Item Description Quantity | Measure | Unit Cost (%) s
1 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA 12.%
2 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA 12.%
3 BCI GROUP SIZE-31 1 EA 12.%
up Two / B - Better (2-3 Year Warranty) - Medium Duty Truck (BCI Group 31, Auto Post and Stud cable will be accept
Continental Battery Award Award
Compant Recommendation | Inland Kenworth Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount Discount
Item Description Quantity | Measure (%) s Unit Cost (%) e
1 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA 5.% $133.46 12.% ]
2 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA 5% $122.41] 12.% [m]
3| BCIGROUP SIZE-31 1 EA No Bid ] 12.%
Group Two / C - Best (5 Year Warranty) - Medium Duty Truck (BCI Group 31, Auto Post and Stud cable h will be accepted)
Award
Parts Authority LLC | Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount
Item Description Quantity | Measure | Unit Cost (%) U
1 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA 72.%
2 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA 72.%
3 BCI GROUP SIZE-31 1 EA 72.%
Group Three / A -Good (1 Year Warranty) - - Serviceable Type (with cells, not sealed/ fee)
Award Award Award
Cummins Inc Recommendation | Inland Kenworth Recommendation J's Mobile Battery Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount iscount Discount
Item Description Quantity | Measure (%) s Unit Cost| (%) s Unit Cost (%) s
1 | BCIGROUP SIZE-4D 1 EA 28.% 518372 12.% [m] $268.56 2.% [m]
2 [ BCIGROUP SIZE-8D 1 EA $248.28 | 28.% [m] 12.% $281.87 2.% 0
3 | BCI GROUP SIZE-31- 1 EA | 825845 | 25% O $133.46 | 12.% O _ 2.%
Group Three / B -Better (2-3 Year - r - Serviceable Type (with cells, not sealed/| fee) |
Award
Inland Kenworth | Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount
Item Description Quantity | Measure | Unit Cost (%) s
1 BCI GROUP SIZE-4D 1 EA 12.%




[ 2 [BciGrouPsizesd | 1 | EA 12.% | |
[ 3 |BCIGROUPSIZE3L-| 1 | EA i 2% | O |
Group Three / C - Best (5 Year - Generator - Serviceable Type (with cells, not sealed/| fee)
Award
lliott auto supply co il Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount
item Description | Quantity | Measure | Unit cost| (%) U
1 BCI GROUP SIZE-4D 1 EA 0.%
2 BCI GROUP SIZE-8D 1 EA 0.%
3 BCI GROUP SIZE-31- 1 EA 0.%
Group Four / A -Good (1 Year Warranty) - Misc. and
D.J. Walworth Award Award Award Award
Enterprises Inc dba | Recommendation | Inland Kenworth Recommendation J's Mobile Battery Recommendation USD Inc. Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount Discount Discount Discount
Item Description Quantity | Measure (%) s Unit Cost (%) e Unit Cost (%) e Unit Cost (%) e
1 BCI GROUP SIZE-U1 1 EA 15.% $98.64 12.% ] $66.84 2.% $72.43 48.% UJ
2 BCI GROUP SIZE-24 1 EA $94.95 28.% a 12.% $120.50 2.% $167.80 48.% U
3 BCI GROUP SIZE-GC2 1 EA $164.95 24.% UJ $169.36 12.% j 2.% $338.43 48.% UJ
4 BCI GROUP SIZE-14L- 1 EA $61.95 20.% U $84.82 12.% U 2.% $72.51 48.% U
5 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA $73.95 | 20.% O $88.00 | 12.% O H 48.%
6 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA $99.95 20.% L) $123.43 12.% L $150.84 48.% a
7 | BCIGROUP SIZE-40 1 EA 520495 | 26.% O $217.49 | 12.% O S151.11 | 48.% 0O
Group Four / B - Better (2-3 Year Warranty) - Misc. and
Continental Battery Award Award Award National Auto Parts Award
Compant Recommendation [lliott auto supply co il Recommendation Inland Kenworth Recommendation Warehouse LLC Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount iscount Discount Discount
ety q . Yes . Yes . Yes . Yes
Item Description Quantity | Measure | Unit Cost (%) Unit Cost (%) Unit Cost (%) Unit Cost (%)
1 BCI GROUP SIZE-U1 1 EA No Bid No Bid [m] $120.72 70.% ] $98.64 12.% UJ 51.356%
2 BCI GROUP SIZE-24 1 EA 15.% $97.95 0.% $90.37 12.% U $146.94 | 44.2766% (]
3 BCI GROUP SIZE-GC2 1 EA 5.% $277.31 70.% j $169.36 12.% U No Bid No Bid UJ
4 BCI GROUP SIZE-14L- 1 EA 10.% $107.55 70.% U $84.82 12.% (] No Bid No Bid U
5 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA No Bid [m] $111.11] 0% O 12.% No Bid No Bid O
6 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA 5.% $437.38 70.% (] $123.43 12.% a No Bid No Bid UJ
7 | BCIGROUP SIZE-40 1 EA $217.28 | 5% O 0.% | 21749 | 12% O No Bid No Bid O
Group Four / C - Best (3+ Years or More y) - Misc. and ts
Award
lliott auto supply co irl Recommendation
Line Unit of Discount
Item Description Quantity | Measure (%) e
1 BCI GROUP SIZE-U1 1 EA 70.%
2 BCI GROUP SIZE-24 1 EA 0.%
3 BCI GROUP SIZE-GC2 1 EA 70.%
4 BCI GROUP SIZE-14L- 1 EA 70.%
5 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA 0.%
6 BCI GROUP SIZE- 1 EA 70.%
7 BCI GROUP SIZE-40 1 EA 0.%




