
Line Item
Group 1 - OEM AUTHORIZED REPAIR 

CENTER - Shop Hourly Rate UOM Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec
1  AUTOMOTIVE (Whole Unit Repairs) Hour $175.00 X $129.95 X $125.00 X $115.00 X $145.00 X No Bid $145.00 X No Bid $100.00 X No Bid

2
 CLASS 1 TRUCKS: GVWR 0 to 6,000 lbs. 
(Whole Unit Repairs) Hour $175.00 X $129.95 X $125.00 X $115.00 X $145.00 X No Bid $145.00 X No Bid $100.00 X No Bid

3
CLASS 2 TRUCKS: GVWR 6,001 to 10,000 
lbs. (Whole Unit Repairs) Hour $175.00 X $129.95 X $125.00 X $115.00 X $160.00 X No Bid $160.00 X No Bid $100.00 X No Bid

4
 CLASS 3 TRUCKS: GVWR 10,001 to 
14,000 lbs. (Whole Unit Repairs) Hour $175.00 X $159.95 X $125.00 X $115.00 X $160.00 X No Bid $160.00 X No Bid $100.00 X No Bid

5
CLASS 4 TRUCKS: GVWR 14,001 to 
16,000 lbs. (Whole Unit Repairs) Hour $175.00 X $159.95 X $125.00 X $115.00 X $160.00 X No Bid $160.00 X No Bid $100.00 X No Bid

6
 CLASS 5 TRUCKS: GVWR 16,001 to 
19,500 lbs. (Whole Unit Repairs) Hour $175.00 X $159.95 X $125.00 X $125.00 X No Bid No Bid $160.00 X No Bid $100.00 X $175.00 X

7
CLASS 6 TRUCKS: GVWR 19,501 to 
26,000 lbs. (Whole Unit Repairs) Hour $175.00 X $159.95 X $125.00 X $125.00 X No Bid $147.00 X No Bid No Bid $100.00 X $175.00 X

8
CLASS 7 TRUCKS: GVWR 26,001 to 
33,000 lbs. (Whole Unit Repairs) Hour No Bid No Bid $125.00 X $125.00 X No Bid $147.00 X No Bid $155.00 X $100.00 X $175.00 X

9
 CLASS 8 TRUCKS: GVWR 33,001 lbs. & 
greater (Whole Unit Repairs) Hour No Bid No Bid No Bid $125.00 X No Bid $147.00 X No Bid $155.00 X $100.00 X $175.00 X

Line Item
Group 2 - NON-OEM REPAIR CENTER - 
Shop Hourly Rate UOM Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec Unit Cost Rec

1 AUTOMOTIVE (After-Market Service) Hour $118.30 X $115.00 X $90.00 X No Bid $105.00 X No Bid $100.00 X No Bid

2
CLASS 1 TRUCKS: GVWR 0 to 6,000 lbs. 
(After-Market Service) Hour $118.30 X $145.00 X $90.00 X No Bid $105.00 X No Bid $100.00 X No Bid

3
CLASS 2 TRUCKS: GVWR 6,001 to 10,000 
lbs. (After-Market Service) Hour $118.30 X $145.00 X $90.00 X No Bid $105.00 X No Bid $100.00 X No Bid

4
CLASS 3 TRUCKS: GVWR 10,001 to 
14,000 lbs. (After-Market Service) Hour $124.80 X $145.00 X $90.00 X No Bid $185.00 X No Bid $100.00 X No Bid

5
CLASS 4 TRUCKS: GVWR 14,001 to 
16,000 lbs. (After-Market Service) Hour $124.80 X $155.00 X No Bid No Bid $185.00 X No Bid $100.00 X No Bid

6
CLASS 5 TRUCKS: GVWR 16,001 to 
19,500 lbs. (After-Market Service) Hour No Bid $175.00 X No Bid No Bid $185.00 X No Bid $100.00 X $175.00 X

7
 CLASS 6 TRUCKS: GVWR 19,501 to 
26,000 lbs. (After-Market Service) Hour No Bid $175.00 X No Bid $147.00 X $185.00 X $155.00 X $100.00 X $175.00 X

8
CLASS 7 TRUCKS: GVWR 26,001 to 
33,000 lbs. (After-Market Service) Hour No Bid $175.00 X No Bid $147.00 X $185.00 X $155.00 X $100.00 X $175.00 X

9
CLASS 8 TRUCKS: GVWR 33,001 lbs. & 
greater (After-Market Service) Hour No Bid $175.00 X No Bid $147.00 X $185.00 X $155.00 X $100.00 X $175.00 X
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