

ATTACHMENT A - SUMMARY OF OFFERS

IFB 26-FMD-009, HVAC Maintenance, Repair, and Replacement Services
Award Recommendation

Offeror	Group I - Commercial Award Recommendation		Group II - Residential Award Recommendation		Group III - Duct Design, Installation, and Fabrication Award Recommendation		Group IV - Low Temperature Coolers/Freezers Award Recommendation		Group V - Commercial (Aviation Only) Award Recommendation		Group VI - Residential (Aviation Only) Award Recommendation		Group VII - Duct Design, Installation, and Fabrication (Aviation Only) Award Recommendation	
Delta Air Conditioning	\$310,500.00	X	\$296,000.00	X	\$277,500.00	X	\$352,000.00	X	\$364,500.00		\$292,000.00	X	\$277,500.00	
Artic Air Heating & Cooling	\$330,200.00	X	\$330,200.00	X	\$300,000.00	X	\$330,200.00	X	\$372,000.00		\$341,000.00		\$341,000.00	
Haci Service	\$341,000.00	X	\$341,000.00	X	\$232,500.00	X	\$372,000.00	X	\$341,000.00	X	\$341,000.00		\$232,500.00	
Evolution Mechanical Services	\$449,500.00	X	\$449,500.00	X	\$210,800.00	X	No Bid		\$449,500.00		\$449,500.00		\$210,800.00	X
A Quality HVAC	\$581,500.00		\$581,500.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$581,500.00		\$581,500.00		No Bid	
Mesa Energy Systems	\$465,000.00	X	\$465,000.00	X	\$465,000.00	X	\$465,000.00	X	\$465,000.00		\$465,000.00		\$465,000.00	
VGA423G	\$940,500.00		\$841,500.00		\$1,600,500.00		\$1,283,700.00		\$940,500.00		\$841,500.00		\$1,600,500.00	