

ATTACHMENT A

Full Legal Name	Senergy Petroleum, LLC	SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS, INC.	Cummins Sales and Service	Flyers Energy LLC
GROUP A - FULLY SYNTHETIC GASOLINE ENGINE MOTOR OILS	\$74,835.56	\$60,272.53	No bid	\$68,129.79
GROUP B-BULK FULLY SYNTHETIC GASOLINE ENGINE MOTORS OILS	\$183,387.99	\$119,597.85	No bid	\$126,123.39
GROUP C- DIESEL ENGINE MOTOR OILS	\$12,803.38	\$1,695.13	\$679.45	\$10,181.63
GROUP D- BULK DIESEL ENGINE MOTOR OILS	\$121,396.30	\$105,397.50	\$123,450.20	\$97,938.60
GROUP E- ENGINE OIL FOR NATURAL GAS & SYNTHETIC FUEL POWERED ENGINES	\$3,682.80	\$2,860.00	\$3,185.96	\$3,296.92
GROUP F- BULK ENGINE OIL FOR NATURAL GAS & SYNTHETIC FULE POWDERED ENGINES	\$81,490.32	\$58,659.40	\$67,567.84	\$66,545.56
GROUP G- AUTOMOTIVE AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID	\$65,326.76	\$34,136.38	\$62,241.72	\$79,843.17
GROUP H- BULK AUTOMOTIVE AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID	\$175,693.61	\$115,183.22	\$152,928.00	\$204,172.25
GROUP I - AUTOMOTIVE MANUAL TRANSMISSION & AXLE/GEAR LUBRICANTS	\$11,549.52	\$8,015.68	No bid	\$10,921.83
GROUP J- RE-REFINED HYDRAULIC FLUIDS	\$2,909.50	\$3,466.31	No bid	No bid
GROUP K BULK RE-REFINED HYDRAULIC FLUIDS	\$229,350.80	\$180,528.60	No bid	\$169,174.60
GROUP L - GREASE	\$93,369.80	\$109,027.69	\$51,733.12	\$84,147.20
GROUP M DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)	\$77,865.50	\$68,124.10	No bid	\$59,615.69
GROUP N - HEAVY DUTY INDUSTRIAL GEAR OIL	\$63,832.45	No Bid	No bid	\$57,192.48
Group O - Central Lube Grease	\$676.20	\$118.84	No bid	\$1,161.13
GROUP P- HYDRAULIC FLUIDS (Virgin)	\$13,118.70	\$4,574.92	No bid	\$20,526.19
GROUP Q BULK HYDRAULIC FLUIDS (Virgin)	\$203,236.60	\$180,528.60	No bid	\$172,807.88
GROUP R Deposit Fees (Refundable Upon Return)	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid
GROUP S - Compressor Lubricants	No bid	No Bid	No bid	No bid
Total	\$1,414,525.79	\$1,052,186.75	\$461,786.29	\$1,231,778.31