
Group I-Automotive and Light Tuck BCI Group Size
Batteries 

Plus

Continental 
Battery 

Company

Factory 
Motor Parts

General Parts 
Distribution

Motive Energy 
LLC.,Dba 

Performance Plus 
Distribution

NPW
One Nation 
Distribution

Parts Mart USD

GROUP I-Line Item 1 24 $110.99 $76.65 $66.37 $133.32 $47.73 $65.93 $79.00 $73.33 $69.33
GROUP I-Line Item 2 27 $110.99 No Bid $89.97 $133.32 $62.22 $95.74 $99.00 $84.33 $79.73
GROUP I-Line Item 3 34 $110.99 No Bid $68.73 $133.32 $52.57 $70.19 $75.00 $80.67 $76.27
GROUP I-Line Item 4 48 $110.99 $69.18 $68.19 $133.32 $60.29 $90.35 $65.00 $96.56 $91.29
GROUP I-Line Item 5 58 $110.99 $68.11 $59.26 $133.32 $44.36 $71.05 $66.00 $71.84 $67.92
GROUP I-Line Item 6 58R $110.99 No Bid $59.26 $133.32 $46.21 $79.55 $68.00 $71.84 $67.92
GROUP I-Line Item 7 65 $110.99 No Bid $73.44 $133.32 $61.07 $86.65 $88.00 $88.00 $83.20
GROUP I-Line Item 8 65AGM $195.99 No Bid $140.30 $168.83 $138.00 $164.61 $94.00 $139.18 $131.59
GROUP I-Line Item 9 75 $110.99 $73.68 $68.73 $133.32 $48.69 $65.51 $63.00 $74.56 $70.49

GROUP I-Line Item 10 78 $110.99 $76.94 $71.08 $133.32 $50.10 $69.61 $79.00 $80.67 $76.27
GROUP I-Line Item 11 86 $110.99 No Bid $59.26 $133.32 $45.49 $78.96 $64.00 $75.78 $71.65
GROUP I-Line Item 12 90 $110.99 No Bid $65.04 $133.32 $46.98 $92.23 $79.99 $83.11 $78.58
GROUP I-Line Item 13 94 $122.99 No Bid $81.31 $147.39 $62.32 $132.53 $83.00 $113.67 $107.47

GROUP II-Medium Duty Truck-BCI 
Group 31, Auto Post and Stud cable 

attachment, Alternates will be 
accepted.

BCI Group Size
Batteries 

Plus

Continental 
Battery 

Company

Factory 
Motor Parts

General Parts 
Distribution

Motive Energy 
LLC.,Dba 

Performance Plus 
Distribution

NPW
One Nation 
Distribution

Parts Mart USD

GROUP II-Line Item 1 31 (AP) $91.99 $83.26  $    79.94 $98.48 $66.14 $123.52 $89.99 $107.63 $92.21
GROUP II-Line Item 2 31 (ST) $91.99 $83.26  $    79.94 $98.48 $66.14 $130.51 $89.99 $119.53 $92.21
GROUP II-Line Item 3 31 $138.39 $92.84  $    91.28 $119.25 $76.39 $98.69 $89.99 $107.63 $92.21

GROUP III-Generator-Serviceable 
type (with accessible cells, not 

sealed/maintenance-free)
BCI Group Size

Batteries 
Plus

Continental 
Battery 

Company

Factory 
Motor Parts

General Parts 
Distribution

Motive Energy 
LLC.,Dba 

Performance Plus 
Distribution

NPW
One Nation 
Distribution

Parts Mart USD

GROUP III-Line Item 1 4D $147.19 No Bid No Bid $140.69 $126.00 $152.92 $149.99 $155.90 $147.39
GROUP III-Line Item 2 8D $199.99 No Bid No Bid $186.25 $154.00 $156.76 $166.00 $212.02 $200.45
GROUP III-Line Item 3 31-POST $111.99 No Bid No Bid $112.55 $89.00 $107.72 $94.00 $107.63 $101.76

GROUP IV-Misc. Equipment and 
Powersports

BCI Group SIze
Batteries 

Plus

Continental 
Battery 

Company

Factory 
Motor Parts

General Parts 
Distribution

Motive Energy 
LLC.,Dba 

Performance Plus 
Distribution

NPW
One Nation 
Distribution

Parts Mart USD

GROUP IV-Line Item 1 U1 $44.79 $34.99 $28.91 $37.51 $32.49 $42.97 $39.99 $44.02 $36.32
GROUP IV-Line Item 2 24 $91.99 $76.65 $56.00 $70.34 $47.73 $65.93 $73.00 $73.33 $75.87
GROUP IV-Line Item 3 GCV2 $123.19 $130.71 $120.85 $99.82 $83.53 $118.79 $119.00 $177.68 $167.99
GROUP IV-Line Item 4 14L-A2 $35.44 $39.53 No Bid $42.20 $39.82 $46.36 $77.00 $38.46 $36.36
GROUP IV-Line Item 5 ETX14 $107.99 No Bid $29.59 $92.45 $36.75 $87.24 $79.00 $38.46 $36.36
GROUP IV-Line Item 6 ETX30L $135.99 No Bid $74.07 $138.01 $69.39 $127.39 $114.00 $79.99 $75.62
GROUP IV-Line Item 7 4D $147.19 $134.06 $123.41 $140.69 $107.71 $152.92 $154.00 $155.90 $147.39

**Low Bid Award will be identified by "Good" low bid line item

Vendor Bid Price Submittal

IFB 24-FSD-010 
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Vendor Bid Price Submittal

Vendor Bid Price Submittal

Vendor Bid Price Submittal

**Low Bid Award will be identified by "Good" low bid line item

**Low Bid Award will be identified by "Good" low bid line item

**Low Bid Award will be identified by "Better" low bid line item
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